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1. INVITATION TO REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL

The bidding process begins with an Invitation to Request for Proposal. The buyer includes the bidders and publishes
the bid request. Once it is published the bidders will receive an e-mail (*) with the following content:

(*) E-mail address that appears on your registration data in Repsol's systems

Dear Supplier, We hereby invite your company to participate in the following Request for Proposal:
REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NAME - no:8100XXXXXX

Deadline for presenting the bid: Deadline
We remind you that your username is: PXXXXXX.

If you do not wish to make a bid, we request that you please enter the tool, access the Request for Proposal and
click on 'Not participating'.
Use the following link to access the application: http://extranet.repsol.com

SUPPORTED BROWSERS:
- ECONOMIC PROPOSAL: INTERNET EXPLORER VERSIONES 8 Y 11, GOOGLE CHROME
- TECHNICAL PROPOSAL: INTERNET EXPLORER VERSIONES 8 Y 11.

Remember that all information regarding this quote request must be submitted through the electronic
tool for call for Request for Proposals.

PLEASE read the bid presentation manual carefully through the following link.

https://www.repsol.com/en/about-us/suppliers-and-partners/index.cshtml

IMPORTANT INFORMATION:

1. Remember to access the tab "notes and attachments” to perform the following actions:

- See al Request for Proposal documents.

- Present your bid attaching the files deem necessary.
- Technical offers must be identified by means of the marker: “technical offer”

2. To submit your bid you must attach the documents you deem necessary and complete the
following steps: save, process and send.

3. We recommend the attached files size be no larger than 10MB in order to optimize the
system's performance.

4. If you do not wish to present a bid, please enter the tool, access the Request for Proposal and click "Do not
participate".
5. To learn about Repsol's general conditions for purchasing and contracting, which are

mandatory for all invited suppliers, please use the following link:

https://www.repsol.com/en/about-us/suppliers-and-partners/index.cshtml
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6. If you have any questions or would like to report an incident, ALWAYS USED SUPPORTED
BROWSERS, you may contact supplier help desk (SAC POVEEDORES), through:

Telephone contact per countries:

- Angola: +244 2-2642-7849

- Bolivia: +591 3-36-60549

- Brazil: +55 21-25597200

- Colombia: +57 1-7-05-19-86

- Ecuador: +593 22-976-610

- United States: +1-832-442-1198
- Peru: +51 1-5172040

- Portugal: +351 213-119-148

- Spain: 902-18-1993

- Trinity and Tobago: +1 868-623-1770 (int.66300)
- Venezuela: +58 281-500-4997

- Others: +34 913387243

Regards, REPSOL

2. ACCESSING THE APPLICATION

Through the link http://extranet.repsol.com indicated in the invitation e-mail you can access the
Repsol bidding application.
To access the system, the supplier must write their username and password.
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o please sign on and we'll
send you right along.

REFSOL
USERNAME
PASSWORD
Change Password? | Forgot Password?

If all the information is correct you will enter the next screen:

(%) Applications and Links -
(@ User Managoment (@ Bid management (@) Bid managermant Holp

To Access your bids, please select the link:
Gestion de ofertas / Bid management / Gestdo de ofertas

The first time your register in Repsol, you will get an Email with you user code and a link to create
your password.

If you don’t receive this email, you can ask to reset your password following the steps:

- Select “Forgot Password?”.
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o@ please sign on and we'll

- i
B send you right along.

USERNAME

PASSWORD

Change Password? n Forgot Password?

In the next screen you will have to fill the username and select “Send Change
Request”.

w» Forgot Password
REPSOL
@ ®
REQUEST VALIDATE RESET
USERNAME

\l |

Back to sign-on

-

- Finally, a last screen is displayed indicating that an email will be received with the
instructions to follow for the reset of the password
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w» Forgot Password
REFSOL

i,
-

global.footer

- If you have followed these steps, in a few seconds you will receive an email with a link to
access to change the password. Once changed, return to the initial screen and enter them.

If your Email address has change and you know you user code and password, you can enter the
system and change the Email address following the steps:

1.- Fill you username and password and enter the system :

B Please sign on and we'll

- i
Pz send you right along.

USERNAME

PASSWORD

Change Password? | Forgot Password?
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(%) Applications and Links
0 User Management 0 Bid management 0 Bid management Help

2.- In the following screen select User Management:

»A REPJO‘ Identity Management F draboasperd | Language |English v

" ~ | Home

| a,

Change My Password

3.- Here you can change your passcode and change you basic data:

3.1.- Change my password: Click “Modify my profile”:

N REPSOL  entty venagement n R - —

) [
Mome
R ‘_

™ User ID dtaboasper00
First Name Daniel
Last Name Taboas

Second Lastname Pereira
I

Confirm Password ]

The password should have at least elght characters and shoubd contain
Upper case letters
Lower case letters
Numbers
You cannot repeat characters more than 2 times in the password.
You cannat repeat any of your previous 24 passwords,
The password must not contain certain regular expressions like year, country, usernsme, etc, (Le. 2012, Spain, ...).

T

Fill your new password in the field Password “Password” and confirm in the field “Confirm Password”,
once you finish please select “submit”.

3.2.- Change basic data: (Name, Lastname, second lastname, telephone number, Email). And submit
the changes “Submit”:
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—f_ REPJSOL identity Management

[tasks <« | Modity My Profile

Home -

e I
" Hodidy My Profile

=Name

L4} | Language | English ~|

sLastname

Second Lastname Pereira

Telephone Number 12345678
Current Emasil 00X @ yahoo. com

In the field below you can change your emall address. A confirmation emall will be send to this new address. Please follow the instruction in the emall to complate the change.

New Emall

Change the profile and select “Submit”.
If your registered Email has changed, you don’t remember your password and you don’t receive
Emails, please get in contact with the Help Desk.

Note: If the access to the bidding process has a delay, please wait for a few minutes. If the Access
page shows the following Message:

-
=y i
= | .. |
B

Sentimos las molestias. El sistema no esta disponible
en estos momentos.

Try following one of these two procedures:
e Press the F5 button to update the page and wait for it to load.
e If the error persists, click on Exit the system and try again later.

Try to avoid closing the browser using the cross on the right top corner of the screen when you are in
the system, as your user session could become temporarily frozen.

The following image shows the error message that you will see if your user session has become
temporarily frozen, or if it is open in a different mode:




. MANUAL FOR PRESENTING BIDS

REFPSJOL

Beyenas: MGC - DUMMY MGE - DUMN

Liestaesones
D SAM > Licacones » Resunen > Liclcanes

@ Guery Tos yo ests ablrto e iro mods - Visual uia

ConsuHas activas

Licitaciores Web. TSN Pusticadn 1) Poote 1) Ceradon 0
S asignaciin categeria. [t Susre 1)

Vad.consus (ot conaste nuery rasmaicar

[resm  Nimers e ofets | Stats stertn

mis0zaTy
102488

In this case you should exit the system and wait few minutes until the system unblocks your user
session or, if it is urgent, call the Help Desk in order for them to unblock it.

3. ACCESSING THE REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL

Once you have entered your username and password, you can access the application internal
personal menu.

Welcome 1o Suppliers & Pariners Portal, dab

(%) Applications and Links

g Uses Management 0 d management Q Bid management Help

In the new version, suppliers have the opportunity to see all the Request for Proposal they have been invited to in
the past. If the event that you wish to access does not appear in the main window, carry out the
following checks:

- Refresh the screen in either case two buttons marked in red

SRM |

Auctions  RFx

D SRM > Auctions > Overview » RFx
Active Queries

eRFxs MAI(583) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0}

eRFxs - All
F¥ Show Guick Criteria Maintenance | — Change Query Define New Query P
View: | Create Response | Display Event Display Response | Frint Freview I Refresh IExpu'l 5 8.
E. Event Number Event Description Event Type EventStatus  StartDate  End Date Response Number Response Status Response Version 0SA  StariTme  Endtme =)
8100012211 Compra Turbina Technical-Economical Fublished 31.03.2017 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 w00 | |
|| s1000z210 Compra Esfera Technical-Economical Fublished 31.03.2017 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
|| s100012108 Copia de 5100012197 Technica-Economical Published 23042017 E200005232 Submited 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
|| s1000z107 Copia de 8100012181 Tecnnical-Economical Fublishea 23032017 8200005218 Supmited 0 oo:m0:00 17:00:00
|| 100012105 Prueba Javi Technica-Economical Published 24022017 £200005218 Submited 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
8100012183 Test RFR ZECO RFQ (Economical) Fublished 22042017 5200005220 Saved 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
8100012191 Copia de 8100012185 AFQ (Economical) Published 26022017 8200005212 Saved 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
|| sw00012190 prueba Javi RFQ (Economical) Published 28022017 £200005217 Submitted 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
|| s100012185 Copia de 5100012176 RFQ (Economical) Fublishea 20022017 8200005191 Supmited 0 0o:00:00 17:56:00
|| s100012176 Copia de 100012175 RFQ (Economical) Published 16022017 | E200005182 Submited 0 00:00:00 13
Last Refresh 02.03.2017 09:59:51 CETRefresh

The date will match the current time:
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SRM
Auctions RFx
D SRM > Auctions > Overview > RFx
Active Queries.
eRFxs All(583) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0)
eRFxs - All
Change Query Define New Query Personalize
View: [Slandard View] || | Creale Response | Display Evenl Display Response | PrintPreview | Refresh Export 8
B Event Number Event Description Event Type EveniStalus  StariDate  EndDate Response Humber Response Status Response Version Q8A  StaiTme  Endtme =]
=
8100012211 Compra Turbina Technica-Economical Published 31.03.2017 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00  00:00:00
8100012210 Compra Esfera Technical-Economical Published 31.03.2017 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
8100012198 Copia de 8100012197 Technical-Economical Published 23.042017 8200005232 Submitted 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
8100012197 Copia de 8100012181 TechnicakEconomical Published 23032017 | 8200005219 Submitted 0 000000 17:00:00
8100012195 Prueba Javi Technica-Economical Published 24022017 | 5200005218 Submitted 0 00:00:00  00:00:00
8100012183 Test RFR ZECO RFQ (Economical) Published 22042017 8200005220 Saved 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
8100012191 Copia de 8100012185 RFQ (Economical) Published 26.022017 8200005212 Saved 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
8100012190 prueba Javi RFQ (Econamical) Published 28022017 | 8200005217 Submitted 0 0000:00  00:00:00
8100012185 Copia de 8100012176 RFQ (Econamical) Published 20022017 | B200005191 Submitted 0 00:00:00 | 17:58:00
8100012176 Copia de 8100012175 RFQ (Economical) Published 16.02.2017 8200005182 Submitted as skl s 00 If
I Last Refresh 02.03.2017 10:04:00 CET Refresh ]

- Open up the search fields in the drop-down menu and check there is no active selection:

SRM

Auctions  RFx
D SRM > Auctions > Overview > RFx

Active Queries

‘eRFxs All(583) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0}

eRFxs - All

Change Query Define New Query Person.

te Response | Display Event Display Response | PrintPreview | Refresh Export « 4

B Event Number Event Description Event Type EventStatus  StartDate  End Date Response Number Response Status Response Version Q84 StatTime  Endtime
3100012211 Compra Turbina Technica-Economical Published 31.03.2017 Ho Bid Created 0 00:00:00 00:00:00

» 2100012210 Compra Esfera TechnicaEconomical Published 31.03.2017 Mo Bid Created 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
I 8100012198 Copia de 8100012197 Technical-Economical Published 23.042017 8200005232 Submitted 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
B 8100012187 Copia de 8100012181 Technical-Economical Published 23.03.2017 8200005219 Submitted 0 00:00:00 17:00:00
N 8100012185 Prueba Javi Technical-Economical Published 24022017 8200005218 Submitted ¢ 00:00:00 00:00:00
B 8100012183 Test RFR ZECO RFQ (Economical) Published 22042017 8200005220 Saved ¢ 00:00:00 00:00:00
| s100012181 Copia de 8100012185 RFQ (Economical) Published 26022017 3200005212 Saved 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
| s1000121%0 prueba Javi RFQ (Economical) Published 28022017 3200005217 Submittd 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
[ s100012185 Copia de 8100012176 RFQ (Economical) Published 20022017 8200005191 Submitted 0 00:00:00 17:58:00
|| s0o02178 Copia de 8100012175 RFQ (Economical) Published 16.022017 8200005182 Submittd 0 00:00:00 13:45:00

Last Refresh 02.03.2017 10:04:00 CET Refresh

SRM

Auctions | RFx

p SRM » Auctions > Overview > RFx

Active Queries
eRFxs ANl(583) Published (0} Ended (0} Completed (0)

eRFxs - All

R Hide Quick Change Query Define New Query Persol

[ Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance | ] wl_ ] &
Bventstates: | |=]
Creation Date: & T >
DeadineDate Fag: | |=|
sas: [ ¥
Response Tmeframe: | |¥|

View: | Create Response | Display Event Display Response | Print Preview | Refresh Export
| Eventhumber  EventDescrition Event Type EventStatus  StartDate  EndDate Responss Number | Response Status Response Version | Q8A  StartTme  End time
J 8100012211 Compra Turbina Technical Economical Fublished 31.03.2017 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 00:00:00
|| eto0012210 Compra Esfera TechnicakEconomical Published 31.03.2017 No Bid Created 0 000000 00:00:00
|| s100012198 Copia de 8100012187 TechnicakEconomical Published 23.082017 Submitted 0 000000 00:00:00
| s100012197 Copia de 8100012181 TechnicalEconomical Published 23032017 Submitted 0 000000 17:00:00

If you still cannot view the Request for Proposal you wish to look at, write the code in the event "Number" field and
press apply:

10
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SRM
Auctions RFx

D SRM > Auctions > Overview > RFx

Active Queries

eRFxs All(583) Published (0} Ended (0) Completed (0)

eRFxs - All
|| = Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance | I Change Query
Event Number: 810012211 To l:l =
EventStaws: | [=]
Creaton Date: & To g
Deadiine Date Flag: I:IE‘
saws: [ T
Response Tmeframe: | |¥]
A
View: |[Standard View] n | Create Response | Display Event Display Response | Print Preview Refresh Export .
B. Event Number Event Description Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date Response Number Response Status Response Version [*E.T%
£100012211 Compra Turbina Technical-Economical Published 31.03.2017 No Bid Created 0

- Finally, by clicking on the event number you will have direct access to the internal information
regarding the Request for Proposal.

4.INFORMATION ABOUT THE REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL

If you have followed the instructions of the previous section correctly, you will now be in the Request for Proposal,
where you can view all the relevant information.

1. The first page ("Information about the Request for Proposal") contains general information about the Request for Proposal.

|%] | [ ciose || Participate || Do Mot Participate || Create Response || Questions and Answers (0 ) || Export [A

RFx Number 8100012210 RFx Name Compra Esfera RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00.00.00 CET
RFx Version Number 2 RFx Version Type Active Version

r' uifxnfonml'iml} tems  Notes and Aftachments |

RFx Parameters | Questions | Noteand Attachments | Table Extensions

Remaining Time ~ 28 Days 12:38:05  RFxOwner ruiz marin, daniel

Time Zone. |CET

Internal Code:
* Supmission Deading] [21.02.2017 | |00:00:00
- . . [1000 [Suggestion |
* Opening Date: |31.03.2017 | [00:00.00 Ciierbany S

Rubro description: | ELECTRICAL MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT
End of Binding Period.

el Awearding Code:
= Criticalty level: [Very Low
w Partners and Delivery Information
Detais [ Add ﬂ Send E-Mail H:.u |\E| Fitter Settin
Function Humber Hame Phane Number
+ Reguester ruiz marin, daniel 91348 8838

2. The second is the "Items" tab where, should the buyer ask for specific bids per items, the
different items to be quoted will be specified for the supplier to enter their prices. It is possible

that the buyer will not request quotes per items. In this case this section will be empty, as shown
in the following image, and you do not have to do anything.

11
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| [ Ciose || Participate |[ Do Not Participate || Create Response || Questions and Answers (0 ) |[ Export | 9 -
RFx Number 8100012210 RFx Name Compra Esfera RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining Time 28 Days 12:33:05 RFx Owner ruiz marin, daniel

RFx Version Number 2 RFx Version Type Active Version

Motes and Attachments ‘

Details || Add Line || Add Subline  |[{][{2][ cut ][ copy || Paste . || Delete Expand All Collapse All Filter Settings Hide Outine

EL LineMNumber temType HemType ProductlD Descripion Lot Alow RFx Response Modification Product Category = RevisionLevel Quantly Unit Currency DeliveryDate Notes Attachments TotalValue nternal tem Number |

If the buyer has asked for quotes per items, an image similar to the following will be seen. By clicking
on the item "Description" field, you can access the details.

RFx Information Notes and Aftachments ]/ Summary r ‘Tracking | |

Details  Add New | Copy Paste Delete Calculate Value

Line Number  _Descripfion Variant ftemType ProductID  Product Category | Product Category Descripion  Required Quantty Submited Quantty Unt Price Currency FPricePer DefveryDate TotalValie RFx/Re
|5 ﬁmma Material 20 30002 000 USD 1 000 _ o
|| - Eozg wehesd

Material 80 &0 002 0,00 USD 1 0,00 or

3. The third tab ("Notes and Appendices") contains the appendices relating to the Request for Proposal. This
section is where buyers usually include any specifications and the basic documentation relating
to the Request for Proposal.

To download it click on the "Description" field.

| [ close |[ Participate |[ Do Not Participate || Create Response || Questions and Answers (0 ) || Export | fi
RFx Number 8100012211 RFx Name Compra Turbina RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining Time 28 Days 12:28:50 RFx Owner ruiz marin, daniel
RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version
Fer et
E Assigned To  Category Text Preview
i
Add Attachment || Edit Description || Versioning . || Delete || Create Qualification Profile Fitter Sedti
Assigned To Category Description File Name: Version Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB) Changed by ‘Changed on
[r' Document Header Standard Attachment Pliggo de Condiciones ‘Oferta tecnica proveedor 901.docx i O docx 13 RY49205 28.02.2017
Document Header Standard Attachment 213 101 1€ d (Oferta economica proveedor 901 docx 1 ] docx 13 RY45205 28.02.2017

*IMPORTANT:

The screen can display a maximum of five appendices. If the buyer has included more than five
documents a scroll bar will appear on the right hand side of the appendices window. Use this to
access the rest of the documents.

12



j MANUAL FOR PRESENTING BIDS

._
REFPSJOL
5. READING AND DOWNLOADING DOCUMENTS

*IMPORTANT
To view the appendices the buyer has attached to the Request for Proposal, you must have the download files
function enabled in your browser. It is normally activated by default but, should you have any
difficulties, you can check it and activate it by following these steps:
- On the home page of Internet Explorer, open the "Tools" menu and select the last item "Internet
options":

& - > [ @ ~ Pigina~v Seguridad Jr | Herramientas v A

Diagnosticar problemas de conexian...

[ B

Volver a abrir dltima sesién de Exploracién

Bloqueador de elementos emergentes 4

Administrar complementos

Trabajar sin conexion

]

Configuracién de Vista de compatibilidad

m Pantalla completa F11
Hola TERE Barras de herramientas 4
Barras del explorader 4
[~] Corre
A mi fic % Herramientas de desarrollo F12
=9

Sitios sugeridos

Herramie Motas vinculadas de OneNote
. !'-\.DliCﬁC Complemento de Lync

o : 2:::; Enviar a OneMote

M. Liquid

Opciones de Internet

= Tasas

- In the "Security" tab, select (1 click only on the mouse) the first icon, "Internet" and click the
"Custom level..." button:

Opciones de Internet . @E

Conexiones SMas I Cpciones avanzadas
General Seguridad | Privacidad | Contenido

Selpchione una zona para ver o cambiar la configuracion de seguridad.

@« v ‘
Sl |j
Internet Intranetlocal  Sitios de confianza Sitios restri =
. m | 3
T

Internet
q Esta es la zona para sitios web de Internet,

Sitios
excepto los incuidos en la zona de sitios de
confianza v en la de sitios restringidos.

Mivel de seguridad para esta zona

Personalizado
Configuracion personalizada.
-Haga dic en Nivel personalizada para cambiar
la configuracién
-Haaa dic en Mivel predeterminado para usar la
configuracion recomendada.

Habilitar ) & ciar Internet Explorer)
iNiveI personalizado. .. i [ Mivel predeterminado ]

[ Restablecer todas las zonas al nivel predeterminada ]

@ El administrador del sistema controla algunas configuraciones.

13
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- On this screen you should have the 3 "Downloads" sections enabled.

#Opcfnnﬁ de Internet ? 2

Configuracién de seguridad: zona de Internet L :
e .

Configuradion

(7) Habilitar -~
il w
@ Descargas
@ Descarga de archivos
(7) Deshabilitar
@ Habilitar
@ Descarga de fuentes
(7) Deshabilitar
@ Hahilitar B
7) Preguntar
@ Pedir intervendan del usuario automatica para descargas de
(7) Deshabilitar
@ Habilitar
iﬁ Habilitar la instalacion de .MET Framewaork
(7) Deshabilitar

If your browser is configured correctly, to access the notes and appendices all you need to do is click
on the document Description field.

| Close || Participate || Do Not Participate || Create Response || Questions and Answers (0 ) || Export E
RFx Number 8100012211 RFx Name Compra Turbina RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining Time 28 Days 12:28:50 RFx Owner ruiz marin, daniel
RFx Version Humber 1 RFx Version Type Active Version

Fiter Seti
E Assigned To  Category Text Preview
[ Add Attachment || Edit Description || Versioning . | Delete |[ Create Qualification Profile | Fiter Setti]
Assigned To Category Description File Name Version  Processor  Checked Out Type  Size (KB)  Changed by Changed on
Document Header Standard Oferta tecnica proveedor 301.docx 1 0 docx 13 RY48205 28022017
Document Header Standard Attachment 0 R Oferta economica proveedor 801.docx 1 ] docx 13 RY49205 28022017

6. UPLOADING RESPONSES

To make your bid, click on the "Create Response" tab, from which you can access the window enabled
for publishing them. Should you not be interested in the making a bid, you must select the "Not
participating" option which will turn down the invitation.

| [Close |[ Participatz | 0o fot Partic\patelcreate Response || Questions and Answers (0 || Export |

RFx Number 8100012211 RFx Name Compra Turbina RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.03 2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining Time 28 Days 12:28:50 RFx Owner ruiz marin, d
RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version

Time Zone: [CET
mesne o Internal Code: | ]
= Submission Deadine: [00:00:00 | L
* Mat/Ser Group Tk hR

* Opening Date
End of Binding Period: | |
Currency:
* Crtaty eves [Very Low ]

[ Details |[ Add . || Send E-Mail [ call || Clear | Fiter
Function Number Name Phone Number

Rubro description: [ELECTRICAL MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT |

B —

= Requester ruiz marin, daniel 91345 8888

14
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When you click on the "Create Response” tab, a screen will open with the terms of use for the tool,
which you should read carefully before accepting.

Tendering terms B

@ CONDITIONS OF USE OF THE SAPISRM TOOL

I, The alows supplers who have called by the Repsal : & user name and
password, 10 carry out the folowing actions:
- Display and downioad the documentation of the application for bids
- Create the bid and
- Submit binding bids
auser provided to Repsol by ts supplers, capacty (o repr suppler . to submt binding bids for the supplier in
which & has For securty reazons and pricr to accessing the applcation, these persons must change the password Intisly assigned 1o hem by Repsal
i Ymnnmummwmmmmmaﬂmmhmmmm this application e of this user the person
who, uses them carries oul binding acts for the suppier for whom you are participating. mmum-ywmmul mmm«mmmmn hmhbﬂ:mmwmh
¢ his user name, 1o all effects, to be made, sent and submitted for and on behalf of the supplier.

.- By pressing the “Create Bic” option, you state and accept voluntarly and expressly that:
- You are drawing up a binding bid for the supplier whom you represent,
- You are fully authorised to make binding bids for the suppler whom you represent.

- The bids that you submi vohurtarity through the application will be understood, to all effects, to be submitted on behalf of the supplier whom you represent.

- Al actions of & company nature and of any olher type recuired to make & binding bid lsgally and with full efficiency for the suppler whom you represert have been that bid they continue to be completely
‘valid and effective.

wwwwwwwwwww i i general, and thal you accept them for and on behalf of the suppler.

. for any inaccuracies or errors that may exist in information, andior the

this user name.

Ve your user andto apply y maintsin their and prevent ther between you end or your
pawers are revoked both you and the supplier for whom you i you and this suppler the use name and

i Repsol.

V1. Repsol wil keep & dudy pr o the electronic , without content. Repsol these be and printed, it
necessary.

Vi the cortents of th in parts andior ertirety, the Spanish version shall prevailin any case.

BRI [eel]

Below we will explain the differences between the two most common types of Request for Proposal:

RFQ (Economical): bids are exclusively economical, are loaded in the Request for Proposal notes and appendices or
in the items (if items are included). The detailed explanation is made in the following section: 1. RFQ
(Economical)

Technical-Economical: bids, can be economical and technical or only technical, are loaded in the
Request for Proposal notes and appendices.

But when loading the technical bids you should check the option: technical document:

| Add Attachment

Here you can upload an attachment. 'ou have to assign it to either the document general data or to an item
* Azsign To: |General Data =

File: [C:\Users\CD10372\Deskto||  Examinar...

Description: | |
* Assign To: |GeneralData ||

Technical document:

If the option technical document is not marked, the system understands that it is a technical
document. In the Technical-Economical bidding there is an obligation to present at least one
technical document.
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The detailed explanation is made in the following section: 2. Technical-Economical.

1. RFQ (Economical): bids can be uploaded in two different ways depending on whether the
Request for Proposal has items or not.

For cases where Items have been included in the Request for proposal, you will access the "ltems" tab to
quote your price. This can be done in two ways:

a. Directly entering in the table columns the data requested by the buyer ("Price", units,
delivery dates, product reference, etc...)

RFx Response Humber 3200005244 RFx Number 8100012228 Status In Process Submission Deadline 30042017 00:00:00 CET ‘Opening Date 30.04.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining Time 58 Days 09:41:25
RFx Owner ruiz marin, danisl  Total Value 0,00USD  RFxResponse Version Number ActiveVersion  RFx Version Number 1
RFx Information Notes and Attachments r Summary }/ Tracking ‘

Delails Add lle Copy Pasie Delete | Calculate Value
w | Copy | —
Line Number  Description Variani HemType Proguctid Product Calegory Product Category Description  Required Quantly Submited Quantiy Unit | Price | Currencl] Price Per [Delivery Date | Total Value  RFx/Response ]l | RFx
m—"_ . 0001 Engine Material 30 30002 | oo0fuso 1 2,00 oo
|| - @omzE welheas Material £ g0 00z | o,00fuso 1 000 0 o

b. Clicking on the "Line number" field. And completing the required fields in the Item Data
field.

RFx RFX Humber 3100012226 Status In Process Submission Deadline 30.04.2017 00:00:00 CET Opening Date 30.04.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining Time 58 Days 09:31.43
RFx Owner ruiz marin, daniel Total Value 0,00 UsSD RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1

"RFx Information E Notes and Attachmenis. r Summary r ‘Tracking ‘

Detais AddNew . | Copy Paste Delete | Calculate Value

Line Number ipti Variant temType ProductlD ProductCategory Product Category Description Required Quantity Submitted Quantity Unit Price Currency Price Per Delivery Date Total Value RFx/Response]
1. 0001 5 [Engine Material 30 30 002 0,00 USD 1 0,00 o0

Material 80 80 002 0,00 USD 1 0,00 o 0

0002[=] wellhead

-Mlmwmm

Identification Currency:
* Configurable tem Number: ‘DDCM | Required Quantity ljl 002
Control Key: Material functional bitted Quantity ’—30| ,Dﬂ2—|
b I Price: | 72| USD Per: | 1uu|0(|z
productCatesory. |
ProductD: | | Incoterm Key/L ocation: | =]l J
Description: |Engine | DelveryDate: | | |00:00:00
ftem Variant Description:  Original ftem Delivery Days:
Further Properties Status and Statistics
Supplier Product Number: IGTF1371BPPV I
_—---
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This option also allows you to add specific notes and appendices to the item, although this is not
recommended (it is better to add notes and appendices to the main body of the Request for Proposal).

For cases where Items do NOT exist, the supplier must simply include the files that make up their bid
in the Notes and attachments or select “No Files” in Basic Data.

e 0O

“ “'ou must load a file in tab notes and attachments or select 'No files’ in Basic Data

T T

RFx Response Number 2200005292 RFx Number 3100012236 Status In Process Submission Deadline 08.04.2017 12:00:00 CET Opening Date 08.04.2017 12:00:00 CET Remaining Tin|
RFx Owner DSTIAPZ Total Value 0,00 USD RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1

tems ;  Notes and Attachments Summary Tracking

Event Parameters Service and Delivery

Status and Statistics

Created On: | 06.03.2017 12:08:43 CET

Created By: |Proveedor Naviera sanda test ]

Last Processed On:  |06.03.2017 12:08:43 CET

Last Processed By:  |Proveedor Naviera sanda test | I}

No Files: []

‘__| Function . Number  Name  Valid from Valid to  Phone Number

The "Add attachment” section is where you should upload the files that make up the bid.

Here you can upload an attachment. ou have to assign it to either the document general data or to an tem

* Assign To: [General Data | =

File: | || Examinar...

* Assign To: [GeneralData | |

17
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ign it to either

Here you can upload You have t

* Assign To: [GeneralData | =

general data or fo an tem

(&2 Elegir archivos para cargar

» CD10372 (\SSMADTCD... »
* Assign To: [GeneralData | =] Organizar = Nueva carpeta =~ 0 @
1 G 0SDisk (C) *  Mombre :
b 53 Aplica (\issmadtcdat0l) (k) Bocen
b 53 departc (\\rm.gr.repsolypf.com) (L:) B acceminen
acc
I ¥ Bdatos (\\ssmadtcdat01) (N:) .D = 5
» @ CD10372 (\SSMADTCDATOS\USUARIOS) (09 J & Adobs
obe
¥ & departa (\rm.gr.repsolypf.com) (P2) & o
58 departh (\\rm.gr.repsolypf.com) (@) B
& |l Repositoric B i;
rab3r
» 6t Red i Mpoc
o Re |40 Mi masica
|/ Mis documentos
w || B4 L3
Nombre: + | Todoslos archivos (%) -
|
L

The “Notes section” allows you add text which will reach the buyer:

bissign to: [GeneralData | v |

Or select “No Files” in Basic Data.

RFx Response Number 3200005282
RFx Owner DSTIAPZ

Event Parameters

Curency:

RFx Number 8100012238 Status In Process Submission Deadline 08.04.2017 12:00:00 CET

Opening Date 08.04.2017 1

Total Value

0,00 USD

RFx Response Version Humber Active Version

RFx Version Humber 1

Service and Delivery

Status and Statistics

Created On: |0603 2017 12:08:43 CET

Created By: |Proveedor Naviera sanda test

Last Processed On: |06CIG 2017 12.08:43 CET

Last Processed By: |vaeedur Naviera sanda test

No Files: []

 Function
[3] The table does not contain any data

 Number

 Valid from

Valid to
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2. Technical-Economical: The process of submitting bids in the case of a technical economic bid is
different from the previous one due to the obligation to include as technical annex at least one of
the documents to be presented

The process begins identically to the RFQ (Economical) process. Inside the Request for Proposal, click on "Create
response", accept the terms and afterwards a window will open in which you can create the bid.

D

Close | Participate [ Do Not Partcipate [

RFx Number 2100012210 RFx Name Compra Esfera RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Remainin|
RFx Version Number 2 RFx Version Type Active Version

Submit | ReadOnly PrintPreview | Check Close Save Questonsand Answers (0)

o “ou must load a file in tab notes and attachments.
0 At least one attachment must be defined as technical
“You are not allowed to enter a tax jurisdiction code for country ES

RFx Response Humber 3200005261 RFx Number 3100012210 Status In Process Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Opening Date 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining T
RFx Owner ruiz marin, daniel Total Value 0,00 UsD RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 2

‘_lAsﬂme\‘.lTu  Category  Description  File Name | Wersion  Technical document . Processor  Checked Out Type  Size (KB)  Changed
[1] The table does not contain any data

In the option: Notes and Attachments== Add Attachment:

Add Attachment

Here you can uplead an attachment. You have to assign it to either the document general data or to an item

* Assign To: |General Data

File: | || Examinar.. |

Descripion: | |
* Assign To: [GeneralData |~
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You can add the files:

MNombre

] CHeta economics provesdes W dec
5 Ofart acnnormien prossades MR o

_ﬁ_umm:mﬁ;u EP_':H -M_F-I.UF

k) Uinicad cle DD R D)
i Aplea {\vmrmadiodasil} K
o departe [Vum.grepaahpl.com) {13
G Badwios (Vusmadecdandl) (N
S Eviaas (O SSMADTCOATOT LSRRI [
5 departa (Vumugraepsalypl.coml ()
S* departh (irmugrrepsohpd comi (G)
g Redt
[ Paned de control
@ Bccesibbad

- . ’)

Homlae - Oefta becrics peeveedon 2 doc

-

If the document to be annexed is a technical document it is necessary to mark the option: technical
document

Here you can upload an attachment. *You have to assign it to either the document general data or to an item
* Azsign To: |General Data =
File: [C:\Jsers\CD10372\Deskto|| Examinar...
* Assign To: [GeneralData |+

Technical document;

Then press

Note: Can also indicate the option: technical document after attaching the document to the bid
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Add Attachment  Edit Description  Versioning - Delete Create Qualification Profile Fitter Settings

Assigned To Category Description File Name Version Technical document Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB) Changed by Changed on
Document Header Standard Attachment o 0. para Cargar en SISPRO.csv 1 [ | O csv i ZP31T122 02.03.2017
Documento Tecnico Documento Técnico

Ll

9

Add Attachment Edit Description Versioning - Delete Create Qualification Profile Fitter Settin
| Assigned To Category Description File Name Version || Technical document Processor  Checked Out Type  Size (KB)  Changed by Changed on
Document Header Standard Attachment [} 0. para Cargar en SISPRO.csv 1 O v 1 ZPsi7122 02.03:2017

Note: In case of not mark any document as a technical, the system will not let you send the economic
technical offer until at least one document is marked as technical:

Submit | Read Only  Print Preview | Check Close Save Delete Questions and Answers (0)

b
“ At least one attachment must be defined as technical
ou are not allowed to enter a tax jurisdiction code Tor country

Add s Clear

RFx Humber RFx Humber 8100012211 Status Saved Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Opening Date 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining Time 28 Days|
RFx Owner ruiz marin, daniel Total Value 0,00 USD RFx Response Version Humber Active Version RFx Version Humber 1
RFx Information tems ‘Summary ; ‘Tracking

b Assigned To  Category

Text Preview

A@d Edit D 4 Delete Create Qualification Profile
Assigned To Category Description File Name: Version Technical document Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB) Chy
Document Header Standard Attachment o 0. para Cargar en SISPRO csv i O O csv 1 Zps
7. SENDING BIDS
To finalise the bidding process, you must send off the bid by clicking on the "submit" button.
|;3‘\lmilﬂead0rw Print Preview | Check Close Save Delete Questions and Answers (0 )
” RFx Number 8100012211 Status Saved Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Opening Date 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Rel

R Submit Document [F 8200005258
(XU wiz'marin, daniel

Total Value 0,00 USD

RFx Response Version Number Active YVersion

RFx Version Number i

Add « Clear

bhssignedTo Category

Text Preview

Add Edit D 4 Delete Create Qualification Profie
Agsigned To Category Description File Name Wersion Technical Checked Out
Document Header Standard Attachment a 0. para Cargar en SISPRO.csv 1 [ ] 1
Document Header Standard Attachment NUEVA WEB REPSOL NUEVA WEB REPSOL.docx 1 (]

Bids may be saved before being sent if you have not had time to complete it or you wish to check it
over before sending it. However, please bear in mind that the bid will not be delivered to the buyer

until you send it.
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IMPORTANT: Remember that when you save a bid, it remains withheld and therefore not sent.

.Ass'grm‘ru Category Text Preview
To Category Checked Out  Type
|| Document Header Standard Attachment ] docx

It will not reach the buyer until you click on "edit response" and then "Submit":
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8. MODIFYING BIDS

Bids made can be modified, as long as the deadline for presenting bids has not passed. There
are two ways of accessing a bid you have previously created:

In one step: Through the direct link to the bid, from your Request for Proposal summary table,
clicking on the bid code.

B SAM = Auctions > Overview > RFx

Active Queries

eRFxs Al (584) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0]

eRFxs - All

[+ Hide Quick Criteria Mai ]

Bventhumper: @[ | ] ®
Event Status: =
Creation Date: & To L

DeadineDateFiag [ [~]
saws: [ [~
Response Timeframe: l:El

View: [[Standard View]  [w|| Create Response | Display Event Display Response | Print Preview | Refresh Export
E. Event Number Event Description Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date R Number R Status Response V)|
8100012211 Compra Turbina Technical-Economical Published 31.03.2017 8200005258 Submitted
| 8100012210 Compra Esfera Technical-Economical Published 31.03.2017 Mo Bid Created
| 8100012198 Copia de 8100012187 Technical-Economical Published 23.04.2017 2200005232 i

- In two steps: Accessing the direct link to the Request for Proposal from your

Request for Proposals summary tabla, and then clicking on the link to the bid in the heading information
of the Request for Proposal.

SRM

Auctions RFx
D SRM > Auctions > Overview > RFx

Active Queries

eRFxs All(584) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0)

eRFxs - All

~ Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance: Change Query D
eventhumeer. &[] ] ®
Eventstaws: [ =]
Creaton Date: To &

Deadline Date Flag; I:IE‘
saws:. [ 7]
Response Timeframe: l:lz‘

View: |[Standard View] | Create Response | Display Event Display Response | Print Preview | Refresh Export .

B/. Event Humber Event Description Event Type

Event Status Start Date End Date Response Number Response Status Response Version Q&A
Compra Turbina Technica-Economical Published 31.03.2017 8200005258 Submitted 0
| S100012270 Compra Esfera Technical-Economical Published 31.03.2017 No Bid Created 0
_ 2100012198 Copia de 8100012157 Technical-Economical Published 23042017 8200005232 Submitted 0
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Time Zone: I_CFI-:T:|
* Submission Deadline: [31.03.2017  |[00:00:00 |
* Opening Date: [31.03.2017  |[00:00:00 |
End of Binding Period: | |
Currency:

* Criticality level: | Very Low

Internal Code: | |
+ watrser Groug: FOT] ke A
Rubro description: |ELECTRICAL MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT |
g Code: [B0339-117363

[ Detais | Add . |[ Send E-Mail [ Call | Ciear |

Technical document Processor Checked Out Type  Size (K§) Cha

[m] O T |

Assigned To Category Description File Name Wersion
1 e

I Document Header Standard Attachment 0. para Cargar en SISPRO.csv 1

7p

To publish the bid once modified, click on the "Send" button.

B Sk e e 01T 20 00 QDO CET N Opesnaliaie a2 20 D00 CE T
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Display RFx Response:
# Edit | PrintPreview | % | Close Withdraw Export Questions and Answers (0)
%] RFx response 8200005258 submited I

issi ine 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Opening Date 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining

RFx Response Number 2200005258 RFx Number 3100012211 Status

RFx Owner ruiz marin, daniel Total Value 0,00 USD RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1
RFx Infermation tems # Summary Tracking
Add Clear
}7 Assigned To  Category Text Preview

Add Attachment  Edit Description  Versioning Delete Create Qualification Profile

Assigned To Category Description File Name Version Techi | Checked Out Type Size (KB)
Document Header Standard Attachment ] 0. para Cargar en SISPRO csv 1 " csv 1
*
IMPORTANT:

If you click on the "Save" button the modified bid will not reach the buyer but will stay WITHHELD in
Saved status (check in the bid heading). Remember to always send your bids once you have made
modifications by clicking on the "SUBMIT" button

9. APPLICATION COMMANDS

Display RFx :

| [close |[ Participate || Do Not Participate || Create Response || Questions and Answers (0 ) |[ Export | l

RFx Humber 8100012210 RFx Name Compra Esfera RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.03.2017 00:00:00 CET Remaining Time 28 Days 06:26:32 RFx Owner ruiz marin, daniel

RFx Version Number 2 RFx Version Type Active Version

fems HMotes and Attachments

‘mm|w|mwm|nﬂgm

Time Zone: |CET
me cone :l‘\ Internal Code: | |
ion Deadline: |31.03.2017 |00:00:00
: * MatiSer Groun [1000 | 7 Suggestion

1. Refresh: this command updates the Request for Proposal information.
2. Close: this command is used to close the Request for Proposal window.
Participate: this command tells the buyer that the provider is registered. This action is not

obligatory to perform by the buyer
4. Do Not Participate: this command is used to turn down an Invitation to Request for Proposal.

5. Create Response: this command is used to present your bid. A new windows opens, where you

can upload your bids
6. Questions and answers: This is a function which allows you to communicate with the buyer. This
does not send instant messages, so the buyer will not see it until he accesses the Request for Proposal.

7. Export: this command allows to export the data to excel

B. BIDS COMMANDS:

Create RFx Response
Submit | ReadOnly PrintPreview | Check Close Save Questions and Answers (0 )
[

25



i

-
REPSJFOL

o v

MANUAL FOR PRESENTING BIDS

Submit: this command is used to send off the offer once you have uploaded your proposals.
Read Only: this command executes the display mode

Print Preview: this command downloads a pdf document with the summary of the offer and
its status

Check: this command reviews the supply and reports the defects to be remedied

Close: this command is used to close the invitation to Request for Proposal window

Save: this command will save the entered information until the current moment and to
modify a previously created bid, as long as the presentation deadline has not elapsed

*IMPORTANT: If the bid has not been saved or sent beforehand, you will lose all the
information.

Questions and Answers: this command allows to have a communication with the buyer. The
communication does not send instant emails, the buyer will not see the messages until he
does not access the application

26





